Gene Maurice
                  





Karl,
 

Thanks for the rapid response and action!! I will get the check in the mail to you tommorow. Really, no joke, the check's in the mail!!
 

Again, thanks
 

Gene Maurice
gene.maurice@attbi.com
Plano, Tx
AMA 3408
NSRCA 877 

-----Original Message-----
From: Karl G. Mueller [mailto:kgamueller@rogers.com]
Sent: Sunday, August 18, 2002 7:58 PM
To: Gene Maurice
Subject: Re: OS 1.60 FX Header
Hi Gene,

 

I'll get going on it tomorrow. Should be able to ship the header by

Wednesday at the latest.

Unable to process plastic at this time. Personal check will be fine.

Cost of header: $40.00US plus $6.50 S&H.

 

Karl G. Mueller
37 Roberts Cres.
Brampton, Ontario, Canada
L6W 1G9

kgamueller@rogers.com
 

----- Original Message ----- 

From: Gene Maurice 

To: Karl G. Mueller 

Sent: Saturday, August 17, 2002 8:40 PM

Subject: OS 1.60 FX Header

Karl,
I finally got the engine and pipe tunnel set up in the Entropy. There was a bit of problem with the down thrust set in the nose ring (2.75 deg. vs. .75 deg.) that I had to correct. That's what happens when you get a "pre-production" fuse. 
 Now that I can measure accurately, what I need is a 1.5 in. rise from the centerline of the exhaust port to the centerline of the tube. The tube should exit on the centerline of the engine.
Please let me know how much and how to pay. Do you accept credit cards or Pay Pal. If you would like a check or money order please let me know where to mail it to.
The header should be shipped to:
Gene Maurice

2516 Royal Birkdale Dr.
Plano, TX 75025
If you need to get in touch with me you can call me at home: 972.396.8621 or work: 214.672.7470.
Thanks
Gene Maurice
gene.maurice@attbi.com
Plano, Tx
AMA 3408
NSRCA 877 

 
 

 


Gene Maurice                                                                                     Phone: (972) 396-8621 

2516 Royal Birkdale Dr.  
                                              Cell Phone: (972) 365-9689                                                          

Plano, TX 75025                                                      E-Mail: gene.maurice@attbi.com

